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Abstract  

Information and communication technologies (ICTs) have a broad impact on countries' economies. ICTs are 
the means that ensure the digital transformation of business and the economy. Digitalisation has a direct 
impact on the labour market. It creates new requirements for the training of personnel, expressed in the 
prioritization of competencies in the field of information and communication technologies. An even bigger 
change, as a result of the introduction of digital technologies in business, is the emergence of new and the 
disappearance of some existing professions. This, in turn, digitalisation poses a number of challenges to 
education related to creating and enhancing the knowledge and skills of learners at all levels. The education 
system has a key role in building basic digital skills that serve as a fundament for adapting the workforce to 
new labour market conditions.  

The new reality on the labour market, requires transformation and modernization of the labour resources 
competence profile. This should become a permanent process of acquiring, updating, improving and 
upgrading knowledge and skills, integrating the specifics of digital technologies. Understanding and realizing 
these needs, as well as the need for adequate action in this direction, are key to the successful adaptation of 
human resources to a dynamically changing labour market environment. 

In the process of clarifying the direct relationship between the education and training of specialists in 
economics, administration and management, their digital competencies and the labour market, the authors of 
this study focused on issues related to professional competence, types of competencies and skills that are 
formed in the process of education in higher education. In addition, they investigated the concept of 
adaptability of the educational process to new economic challenges. The authors also studied the formation 
of the professional competence of future economists in the adaptive-digital environment of higher education. 

In order to meet the needs imposed by the process of digital transformation, the education system must 
implement technological advances, digital solutions, and innovations within a certain period. In this sense, 
the construction of digital and related skills and competencies of the population, respectively the workforce, 
should be among the main goals of formal education, incl. higher education, and to become an integral part 
of the curricula. In particular, the higher education system is directly responsible for creating conditions and 
models for the transfer of new knowledge, technologies and competencies required by the labour market. In 
higher schools, the fundamental skills of each specialist are formed, incl. cognitive abilities, contributing to 
the rapid acquisition of new knowledge; functional skills that contribute to the performance of specific 
activities specific to individual professions, and basic knowledge - a set of principles and facts that are 
handled in career development in the respective professional field. 

Establishing a viable and adaptable to the constantly-changing requirements of the labour market system of 
higher education requires a change in the conceptual model of the system itself. The adaptive educational 
environment of higher educational institutions (HEIs) is defined as an innovative integrative system, including 
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educational activities based on ICT; innovative teaching methods; learning technologies; technical means 
that facilitate the learning process; adequate information and resource provision. In addition, all this should 
be in accordance with the potential and needs of students. It is necessary to focus not only on the technical 
means of teaching in the digital environment but also on the technology of teaching, teacher training, 
preparation of curricula and disciplines, development of new digital learning content and more. 

In the conditions of adaptive digital environment, HEIs are forced to adapt to the education and training of 
specialists in a timely manner, despite the fast pace of penetration of digital technologies in the labour 
market compared to educational institutions. For this reason, the efforts of university professionals to prepare 
teaching materials that are adequate and reflective of the changes in the real economy are an extremely 
important factor in the training of specialists in economics, administration, and management. The 
determining factor for the effectiveness of the formation of professional competence of economists, in this 
case, is the achieved level of digitalisation and the use of innovative tools, teaching aids, teaching methods 
and more. 

It is obvious that the digital transformation leads to fundamental and complex changes in the way business 
processes are carried out. These changes are an important factor for the development of the economy and 
are related to the emergence of new services and sectors, the creation of new jobs, but also qualitative 
changes in the necessary characteristics of the workforce. The ability to work with e-mail, social networks 
and other mobile platforms is no longer a competitive advantage for a potential worker. In addition, skills 
need to be constantly upgraded and improved due to the rapid pace of digital technology development. 
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1. INTRODUCTION 

Information and communication technologies (ICTs) have a broad impact on countries' economies. They are 
the means by which the digital transformation of business and the economy takes place. Through ICTs, the 
economy becomes an increasingly dynamic system that needs flexible and timely solutions. They, in turn, 
are a function of the knowledge and access to information provided by digital technologies and reliable digital 
infrastructure. 

In the fundament of building a digital economy are industries that develop software applications and systems 
and manufacture a variety of connectivity devices. Digital platforms allow economic agents who are not 
directly involved in the IT field to participate in this process. The digital economy, therefore, consists of 
relationships based on the implementation of digital technologies. The very process of implementation and 
application of these technologies in economic activity places new requirements on the organisation and 
management of production and provides it with the necessary resources. 

Digitalisation has a direct impact on the labour market. It creates new requirements for the training of 
personnel, expressed in the prioritization of competencies in the field of information and communication 
technologies. An even bigger change, as a result of the introduction of digital technologies in business, is the 
emergence of new and the disappearance of some existing professions. This, in turn, poses some 
challenges to education related to creating and enhancing the knowledge and skills of learners at all levels. 
The education system has a key role in building at least basic digital skills to serve as a basis for adapting 
the workforce to new requirements of the labour market. 

2. MAIN BODY 

The importance of an economy, established on knowledge and information as the main strategic resource of 
production, has been emphasized since the end of the XX century. Nowadays, the circulation speed of 
creating, changing and disseminating information and knowledge is another especially important aspect for 
the development of the economy. ICTs play a key role in this process, as they provide much easier, faster 
and cheaper access to information and knowledge. Therefore, ICTs are defined as a catalyst for change and 
a source of cultural, economic, political and educational transformations. 

The digital economy is invariably related to innovation and new technologies, in particular digital 
technologies, which increase the interconnection of the economic system elements. New technologies 
penetrated all spheres of public life, changing the way people live, make decisions, communicate, study, 
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work, etc. They bring unseen challenges to society, business and people's daily lives (Zahariev, A. et al., 
2022). The use of digital technologies is changing traditional business practices and models and the service 
provision in all economic sectors, incl. the public sector. 

Digital technologies support the creation, storage, monitoring and dissemination of information and 
knowledge, which increases the efficiency of activities in the enterprise, increases productivity and creates 
value through new methods and models. All this is related to increasing competitiveness and development 
opportunities of enterprises and the economy. Digitalisation stands out as the third most important factor for 
the economy's competitiveness (Boikova, T., Zeverte-Rivza, S., Rivza, P., & Rivza, B., 2021). For this 
reason, investments in information technologies have risen recently. Mostly this happens in the service 
sector, which is also the fastest developing in the world - financial services, insurance services, trade etc. In 
this manner, new technologies are becoming an important factor in economic growth. In addition, new 
technologies are a key tool for integrating economies into the global economy, as they facilitate 
communication and "cross-border interaction with suppliers, customers and competitors" (Singh, A. & Hess, 
T., 2017). 

The digital economy establishes conditions for economic growth given the rapid development and 
consolidation of companies in the sectors of information and telecommunications technologies, which are the 
basis for building a digital economy. As a result, professions and their characteristics are changing, and 
employment in the IT industry is increasing. The demand for IT specialists is increasing, which increases 
payment for these jobs. Therefore, ICTs shape the characteristics of the labour market and determine 
relations between participants. 

New information technologies and electronic communication also shape up consumer behaviour and change 
conducting production and trade relations. Shopping online and communication through social media or 
receiving information increases in cyberspace. Homes easily become "smart" through the use of various 
smartphone applications or gadgets based on artificial intelligence. The tendency foresees educational, 
health and public services to be offered more and more in electronic format. Thus, the use of new digital 
technologies is gradually becoming a new principle of the economy and is about to radically change 
traditional business rules. If companies are unable to adapt to these changes, they become less competitive 
and are likely to lose market position (Verhoefa, P. C., Broekhuizen Th., Bart, Y. Bhattacharya, A., Qi Dong, 
J., Fabian, N. & Haenlein, M., 2021). The same is valid for small businesses. If they fail to acquire the 
competencies necessary to work with new technologies, they become less rational in their behaviour as 
consumers and lose their competitiveness in the labour market. 

Therefore, modern technologies such as big data, cloud systems, robotics, artificial intelligence, 3D 
technology, the Internet of things, blockchain etc. are a prerequisite for digital transformation in the economy. 
At the same time, they are a means to an end. In the process of digital transformation, are observed 
changes of an evolutionary and gradual nature, but there may also be ones that are revolutionary by nature 
(United Nations, Economic and Social Council, 2015, p. 9). The revolutionary change in development and 
implementation of ICTs brings an entirely new business model. The new business model logically leads to a 
change in the company's development strategy, corporate culture and organisational structure. 

Digitalisation is the fundament of digital transformation. Fragmentation of information into small parts (bits), 
through which it acquires a digital form (Brennen, J. S. & Kreiss, D., 2016), allows for easy storage, 
processing and distribution through various systems. Digital information has another advantage - it can be 
compressed (Negroponte, N., 1995), which makes it possible to store a huge amount of data (Orehov, M., 
2020). But digital content requires the use of appropriate digital technologies. Therefore, the dissemination 
and use of digital information are linked to the digitalisation of the economy and business. In other words, it 
is necessary to implement digital technologies in business activities such as management, communication, 
customer and supplier relations, distribution, logistics, finance, etc., to reap the corresponding benefits for 
business. As a direct effect, this optimizes existing business processes, reduces costs, generates revenue 
and improves the user experience (Pagani & Pardo, 2017). The main tool in this regard, is the use of digital 
platforms and web-based applications, which perform two functions - on the one hand, intermediaries, and 
on the other - they create the infrastructure. 

In the modern economic environment, digital platforms and social networks facilitate sharing and organising 
resources, create information infrastructure and provide communication and coordinated actions between 
participants in the business system (partners, suppliers and customers). Digital platforms make it possible for 
non-company software developers to design different applications. Through social networks, users share 
information, generate content and participate in companies' innovative projects through recommendations 
and comments about the products and services they offer. Thus, applications become a joint development 



Proceedings of SOCIOINT 2022- 9th International Conference on Education & Education of Social Sciences 
13-14 June  2022- Online Conference 

 

ISBN: 978-605-06286-6-1 190 

 

and bear the hallmarks of a personalized product or service. In this way, all participants in the business 
system benefit, which is the trend in the new economy - mutual benefits and relationships based on 
cooperation. 

As a result of technology, the intellectual component of labour increases at the expense of the routine, based 
on repetitive operations in a predictable environment. Routine activities are mostly taken over by machines, 
and as a result, human labour is concentrated on creative and social-communicative processes. It is based 
on non-standard thinking, decision making, people management, and emotional communication. At the same 
time, many of these purely human (so far) activities are complemented by the capabilities of modern 
technology and thus form a synergistic effect in terms of labour intensification and productivity. The 
introduction of digital technologies modifies the very nature of labour and labour relations, establishes a new 
organisation of labour and brings new requirements to the labour market. 

Changes in the characteristics of labour bring changes in labour relations. In the conditions of digital 
transformation, they become more complex and rise to a higher level. Modification of labour relations is 
observed in the following aspects (Golovenchik, G. G., 2018): 

• The model of vertical business relationships in companies, carried out on the principle of "order-execution" 
is replaced by horizontally developed relationships, meaning managers are no longer just managers, but 
people who effectively organise, coordinate and directly participate in the production process; 

• Communication between employers and employees, as well as between employees themselves, in a virtual 
environment, becomes less and less related to time and space. This forms a special kind of partnership 
based on cooperation and trust; 

• Gradually weakens the dependence of employees (especially if they are qualified) on their managers. 
Increased autonomy enables employees to determine and be responsible for the volume of their work 
commitments, deadlines, place of work, work schedule, payment, and work-leisure balance; 

• The existing philosophy of "one job for life" in the traditional economy and lifelong employment with one 
employer is being replaced by the desire and opportunities for independent choice of direction and pace of 
professional development. Employees are free to form and manage a portfolio of professions and work 
commitments in search of better conditions and achieving professional and personal satisfaction. 

The development of the digital economy leads to the reorganisation of the labour process itself. It contributes 
to the development and widespread use of modern forms and ways of organising work. Modern technologies 
transform production processes in a way they increase the flexibility of workplaces and make it possible to 
work from home or another place convenient for the employee; work while travelling; work combining 
professional and personal commitments (raising a child, caring for a close relative), etc. Nowadays, the most 
popular is the remote form of work. Unlike the industrial revolution, which caused a mass migration of labour 
resources, the digital economy creates jobs without the need for a physical change of settlement or crossing 
national borders. Innovative online platforms overcome the geographical factor and harmonise the interests 
of employers and employees. 

These Internet platforms, where labour demand and supply "meet" are another aspect of organizational 
change in the field of labour. Through these platforms, employers have access to the workforce they need, 
and specialists find and perform work according to their qualifications from anywhere in the world and 
without the limitations of astronomical time. In this regard, flexible work schedules, individual work schedules 
and part-time work are increasingly applied. They aim to optimise the relationship between work and 
personal life and improve the physical, emotional and mental state of man without negatively affecting 
productivity. Moreover, as technology increases productivity, incl. by saving time (for getting to the 
workplace, contacts with contractors and communication with employees and customers) creates conditions 
for reducing working hours resp., days and working week. This will further increase the free time of economic 
subjects and will establish preconditions for increasing human capital and hence the overall benefits. 

Another manifestation of new technologies' transformative impact on the organization of labour is replacing 
permanent employees with long-term contracts, with temporary employees for the implementation of specific 
tasks or projects (The World Bank, 2019). In the conditions of digitalisation, companies segment their 
production activity through the online platforms to provide realisation of separate tasks or processes to 
external contractors, with whom they conclude temporary contracts. This, on the one hand, reduces costs 
and streamlines activity, and on the other - creates conditions for using the services of the best professionals 
in the industry (worldwide) without having to pay a high price all year round. 
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The changes considered disturb the relative balance of the labour market and significantly change its 
characteristics. According to a World Bank report, the impact of digital technologies on the labour market has 
at least three aspects (The World Bank, 2019): increasing the productivity and efficiency of the employed in 
a given position; replacement of human labour with machines and reducing of labour demand, resp. of 
employment; increase in the number of jobs offered due to the emergence of new productions (and/or 
functions) and the increased demand for new goods and services. 

In conditions of dynamic economic development and intensified competition, it is quite natural for companies 
to strive to implement modern technologies and innovative production methods. They allow more rational 
use of available human resources and more efficient organisation of workplaces, increase productivity and 
quality of work, expanding the product portfolio of the company. In this sense, digitalisation is not only not a 
threat to jobs but also contributes to increasing production efficiency and in general - increasing the 
comparative advantages of the business structure. 

In other cases, however, the introduction of technology leads to job cuts and rising unemployment. Guided 
by the principle of rationality, employers prefer to replace workers with machines. This is observed mainly in 
areas where routine low-skilled work predominates and there are greater opportunities for automation. 
Cheaper technology and increased consumer demand transfer these processes to higher skilled labour in 
standardised professions. All these factors at first glance have a negative impact on employment and 
increase the sense of conflict between labour and technology. 

In fact, increased productivity as a result of technological innovation has led to lower commodity prices, and 
rising income and demand, which ultimately stimulates job creation and increased employment. Thus, the 
initial negative effect of new technologies on some areas of labour is neutralised and the number of jobs is 
generally increased. Their growth is observed mainly in high-tech industries and creative and analytical 
activities (New Markets and New Jobs in the Digital Economy, 2016). 

Of course, not all employees, industries and economies fully and equally benefit from the positive effects of 
technology. Job cuts in some industries are offset by the creation of new ones in others. For some people, 
the risk of losing their job for a longer period of time is higher and it is determined by many factors, incl. 
subjective such as age, gender, education, learning ability, adaptability, etc. In some countries, the achieved 
level of economic development, the structure of the population, the nature of the activity of the companies, 
etc. limit the possibilities for the application of modern technologies. Nevertheless, their impact on the state 
and dynamics of jobs becomes more tangible and determines the evolution of the future labour market. 

It is important to emphasize that despite all its advantages and disadvantages, technology cannot completely 
replace living labour. Many areas require skills that technology does not have at this stage, especially for 
activities such as critical thinking, leading and motivating people, negotiating, solving complex problems, etc. 
Therefore, at this stage, the role of technology is not as much to cut jobs as to improve them and stimulate 
staff development according to new requirements. 

All this determines the following trends in the labour market (Chto takoe tsifrovaya ekonomika, 2019): 

• Reducing demand for professions related to the implementation of recurring operations; 

• Reducing the life cycle of professions; 

• Emergence of new functions and professions; 

• Increasing the demand for specialists with the ability and desire to use new technologies and through these 
new technologies to create new, competitive products; 

• Increasing the requirements for flexibility and adaptability of staff; 

• Increasing the demand for soft skilled staff. 

The new reality in the labour market requires transformation and modernisation of the competence profile of 
the labour resources. This should become a permanent process of acquiring, updating, improving and 
upgrading knowledge and skills, integrating the specifics of digital technologies. Understanding and 
awareness of these requirements, as well as the need for adequate action in this direction, are key to the 
adaptation of human resources to a dynamically changing environment. Development of the education and 
training system and the formation of attitudes toward lifelong learning play a key role in this process. 

To meet the needs imposed by the process of digital transformation, the education system should implement 
technological advances, digital solutions and innovations within a certain period. In particular, the higher 
education system is directly responsible for establishing conditions and models for new knowledge, 
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technologies and competencies transfer required by the labour market. According to Miloš Krsti´c et al., 
higher education is a key factor for sustainable economic development, as it plays a crucial role in 
determining a country's competitiveness, whether at the local, regional or national level (Lane, J., 2012).  
Sanjaya Lall (Lall, S., 2001) points out, that "workforce skills at all levels" (Johnson, S., 2015) are a key 
factor in competitiveness, especially in a dynamic and digitalising economic environment. This means that 
continuous efforts must be taken to form and develop adequate human capital with a focus on the skills 
required in the workplace (Khan, M.; Kiani, F.A.; Ashraf, A.; Iftikhar-ul-Husnain, M, 2009), resp. meeting the 
requirements of the labour market. In this sense, the construction of digital and related skills and 
competencies of the population, resp. the workforce should be among the main goals of formal (incl. higher) 
education and become an integral part of the curricula. 

Additional incentives in this regard were created by the new economic and social reality observed in the last 
two years, caused by COVID 19, which in practice proved the great importance of digital transformation and 
the need for up-to-date digital skills. They have become a challenge for states and international 
organizations. National governments, through public policies, are responsible for ensuring a stable and 
accessible digital infrastructure for all users, and this is a fundamental precondition for the digital economy's 
proper functioning. In other words, the main task of the government is to establish an institutional and legal 
environment that encourages innovation and the integration of digital technologies. In such a situation, it 
relies on the education system as the main government tool that can prepare society for such a 
transformation and the effects of its implementation. (Czubala Ostapiuk, M. R., & Benedicto Solsona, M. 
Ángel, 2021). In this context, it is necessary to emphasize that the impetus for faster digitalisation of the 
educational process in higher education, due to COVID 19, is not temporary and this process will not slow 
down after the end of the pandemic. Over the past two years, the higher education system has had the 
opportunity to explore the opportunities that digital learning offers, leading to the increasing implementation 
of so-called hybrid learning - a combination of face-to-face and distance learning. In this regard, through the 
National Recovery and Resilience Plan of the Republic of Bulgaria, with the additional support of the 
Program "Education" 2021-2027, it is planned to expand the combined method of teaching (face to face and 
distance) by developing innovative curricula and introduction of new teaching methods (project and problem-
based, research training, etc.) that allow high efficiency of the educational process. 

Higher schools form the fundamental skills of each specialist incl.: cognitive abilities, which contribute to the 
rapid acquisition of new knowledge; functional skills that contribute to the performance of particular activities 
specific to individual professions and basic knowledge - a set of principles and facts handled in career 
development in the respective professional field. In the scientific literature, the adaptability of the educational 
process is mainly associated with the use of ICTs to provide flexibility, focus on personal interests and 
individual characteristics of the learner, and to a much lesser extent the question of the digital readiness of 
staff for the labour market. 

The development and implementation of new ways of doing business through digital solutions and digital 
tools largely determine the evolution of professions and the labour market, and hence the sought-after new 
digital skills and competencies of young professionals. Preparing these new professionals for the labour 
market, and their digital preparedness for its requirements largely depend on higher education and the ability 
of the system to meet the current needs of both employers and students. Moreover, the digitalisation of 
higher education is a process that affects not only the education and training of HEI’s staff but also offers 
various optimisation management strategies to improve the quality of education (Lazić Z, Đorđević A, 
Gazizulina A., 2021). The systematic and purposeful approach of higher education institutions to this 
problem can multiply its beneficial effects not only in terms of improving the training of future professionals 
but also in improving the quality of education and the authority of the institution itself. 

Establishing a vital and adaptable to the ever-changing demands of the labour market higher education 
system requires a change in its conceptual model. The adaptive educational environment of HEIs is defined 
as an innovative integrative system, including educational activities based on ICTs; innovative teaching 
methods; learning technologies; technical means that facilitate the learning process; adequate information 
and resource provision. And all this must be consistent with the potential and needs of students (Bakhmat & 
Sidoruk, 2019). 

In this regard, it is necessary to focus not only on the technical means of teaching in a digital environment 
but also on the technology of teaching, academic staff training, preparing curriculum and disciplines, new 
digital learning content creation etc. The main purpose of technical teaching means in a digital environment 
is to provide the process of teaching and acquiring new knowledge, skills and competencies, but a key role 
in this process is assigned to teachers and their ability to transfer this knowledge to learners. The 
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digitalisation of education inevitably requires the development of new adequate to the economic conjuncture 
curricula, as well as the development and implementation of digital learning content that meets the needs 
and expectations of students and employers. The creation of qualitatively new digital teaching materials 
presupposes a high level of digital competence of university lecturers. For this reason, teacher training and 
the continuous process of improving their digital skills and competencies are the factors that have a major 
impact not only on digitalisation in higher education but also on the students' digital readiness for the labour 
market. Learning in a digital environment, including the application of innovative teaching methods and 
techniques and the involvement of learners in the process, creates natural preconditions for increasing their 
digital skills and competencies and thus ensuring their digital readiness for the labour market. This statement 
is especially valid for students majoring in Economics and Administration and Management. The strong 
relationship between professions in these areas and digitalisation requires students to acquire fundamental 
digital skills and competencies that will form their digital readiness for professional realisation in the course of 
study. Most commonly, this happens through applying learning methods such as "learning by doing" or case 
studies, which allow students to gain not only the knowledge they need but also the key competencies and 
skills to cope in a real working environment. 

In an adaptive digital environment, higher education institutions are forced to adapt in a timely manner to the 
education and training of specialists, despite the exceeding pace of digital technologies entering the labour 
market compared to educational institutions (Claro et al., 2012; Ross & Sennyey, 2008). For this reason, the 
efforts of university professors to prepare adequate, reflective of changes in the real economy teaching 
materials are an extremely important factor in the teaching specialists in economics, administration and 
management. The determining factor for the effectiveness of the professional competence formation of 
economists, in this case, is the achieved stage of digitalisation and the use of innovative tools, teaching 
means, teaching methods etc. (Illge & Schwarze, 2009; Charness & Kuhn, 2011). Traditionally, the 
application of technology as an innovative method of learning and teaching in HEIs is significantly higher 
than in other educational phases, as a result of the close relationship between universities and business and 
the efforts of higher education to build and operate the "business-education" ecosystem. 

The National Recovery and Resilience Plan of the Republic of Bulgaria puts a special emphasis on digital 
readiness and the acquisition of specific digital competencies for realisation in the labour market. It foresees 
developing and delivering unified digital skills profiles in key professions during the period 2021-2023. The 
development of these profiles will take into account the specific characteristics and activities related to 
practising different professions. It goes through the following stages: identifying the deficits of specific digital 
skills in pilot professions, ensuring the relationship between the necessary knowledge and skills and the 
requirements of the future labour market to achieve a competitive and developing economy based on 
technological development and sustainable jobs. The unified digital skills profiles in key professions will allow 
HEIs to adapt their curriculum to the labour market requirements and ensure that graduates own the 
necessary digital skills and knowledge for their future careers. 

3. CONCLUSION 

Digital transformation requires a flexible approach, private and public investment in innovation and 
technology, new skills and change in institutions and policies to meet the conditions needed by the modern 
economy. As technological change is significantly outpacing the process of adopting social, political and 
economic conditions and institutions to new realities, the efforts in this direction must be a priority. There is a 
serious lag in time between the digital technologies development and their application in business, on the 
one hand, and staff training for working with new technologies, on the other. Due to these circumstances, it 
is necessary to highlight some preconditions for digital economy development, namely: 

• Introducing new, horizontally oriented and data-based business models; 

• Creating competitive advantages for companies in conditions of increased global competition through the 
extensive use of the Internet and ICTs in production and trade; 

• Using web-based user-friendly applications to please customers, aiming not only to make sales or orders; 

• Ensuring secure digital connectivity for management, business operations and communication; 

• Formation of digital knowledge, skills and competencies in staff and users, as well as readiness for lifelong 
learning, as in just 10 years 90% of jobs will require digital skills (Robbert van Eerd & Jean Guo, 2020). 

Digital transformation leads to fundamental and complex changes in carrying out business processes. These 
changes, in turn, are a major factor in economic development. They are related to the emergence of new 
services, economic sectors and new job creation, but also to the qualitative changes in the workforce 
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characteristics. The ability to operate with e-mail, social networks and other mobile applications is no longer 
enough to form competitiveness in those who search for a job. In addition, digital skills should be constantly 
upgraded and improved due to the expeditious pace of digital technology development. 

Forming an adequate attitude toward lifelong learning and the acquisition of basic digital skills and 
competencies should start in the educational system. This is, first of all, related to the introduction and 
application of digital technologies in education, and in particular in higher education. In this regard, it is 
necessary to build digital skills and competencies in the academic staff, i.e. the people who transfer 
knowledge to the learners. Executing these two conditions will contribute to the higher quality and efficiency 
of the educational process and to achieving higher flexibility in the course of speciality training. The 
innovative teaching methods based on digital technologies establish a natural environment for forming and 
upgrading students’ skills and competencies, which are the basis that ensures their labour market readiness 
in the context of digital transformation. 
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